
 
CENTRAL POLLUTION CONTROL BOARD 

LAW DIVISION 
 

Scheduled for Hearing from 01st October, to 12th October 2018 
 

S 
No 

Case No. & Title Advocate & 
Division 

Case summary Action Due and 
Compliance by 

CPCB 
SUPREME COURT OF INDIA ( 12 Cases) 

1.  W.P.(C)No.13029 of 
1985 M.C. Mehta vs 
Union of India & ors 

Shri A.N.S. 
Nadkarni 

Ld.ASG, & Shri 
G.S. Makker 

(AOR) 
I/c Air Quality 
Management 

(AQM) 

Vehicular Pollution in 
Delhi. 

Reply filed. 
Listed              
on 03.10.2018 

2.  Writ Petition (Civil) 
No. 4677 of 1985 
M.C. Mehta Vs 
Union of India & ors 
(Initially dealing 
technical Division 
was WQM-I, 
presently UPC-I & 
UPC-II division is 
also dealing with 
this issue). 

Adv.  Vijay 
Panjwani 

I/c WQM-I 

Pollution by industries 
in Delhi, presently 
Hon’ble Court dealing 
with the sealing issues 
in Delhi. 

Reply filed. 
Listed              
on 03.10.2018 

3.  SUO MOTO WRIT 
PETITION No. 1 of 
2015. CPCB is 
Respondent no 2 

Adv. Avijit Roy 
I/c UPC-II 

OUTRAGE AS 
PARENTS END LIFE 
AFTER CHILD’S 
DENGUE DEATH. 

Reply filed. 
Listed              
on 03.10.2018 

4.  Writ Petition (C) No. 
13381 of 1984 M.C. 
Mehta Vs Union of 
India & ors . Latest 
I.A 105894 OF 2017 
filed by CPCB for 
handing over the 4 
manual ambient air 
quality monitoring 
stations to UPPCB 
has been filed on 
13/10/17. 

Adv Vijay 
Panjwani 

I/c Air Quality 
Management 

(AQM) 

Taj Pollution Matter, 
Colour changing of Taj 
& proper preservation 
of Taj. 
 

Reply filed. 
Listed              
on 05.10.2018 



5.  Civil Appeal No. 
5272 of 2016 with 
Interlocutory 
Application No. 1 of 
2016 (Kahima 
Nongstoin Land 
Owners, Coal 
Traders and 
Producers 
Association Vs All 
Dimasa Students 
Union, DIMA Hasao 
District Committee 
& Ors Respondent 
No. 4 

Adv. Satish 
Kumar 

I/c IPC-II: 
Energy 

Metallurgical 

Related to Coal 
Mining. 

Listed              
on 05.10.2018 

6.  CIVIL APPEAL No. 
7437 of 2018 
(Conservation 
Action Trust & 
Another Vs. 
Ministry of Coal and 
others) 

Adv. Avijit Roy 
I/c IPC-II 
:Energy 

Metallurgical 

This present civil 
appeal is filed against 
the impugned 
judgment dated 
24.7.18 by NGT, 
Principal Bench New 
Delhi passed in O.A 
No. 670 of 2016 titled 
as Conservation Action 
Trust & anr Vs. 
Ministry of coal & Ors. 
as this matter is 
related to burning of 
fires in coal mines 
located across the 
various part of the 
country. 
 

Listed              
on 06.10.2018 

7.  CIVIL APPEAL NO 
13120 OF 2017: 
Ravinder Chanana 
& Ors. Vs. Delhi 
Secretariat &Ors. 

Adv. Avijit Roy 
I/c UPC-II 

This appeal is against 
the NGT (PB) order 
dated 02.02.2017. This 
matter is related to 
waste to energy. 

Reply filed. 
Listed              
on 08.10.2018 

8.  Civil Appeal 
No.9703-9706 of 
2013 Chief 
Secretary of 
Rajasthan Vs 
National Green 
Tribunal Bar Assn. 
& ors. Respondent 
No.41 

Adv Vijay 
Panjwani 
I/c IPC-II 
:Energy 

Metallurgical 

Related to Mining 
Work 

Reply filed. 
Listed              
on 08.10.2018 



9.  SLP (C) No. 23633-
23634 of 2010 
Vellore Dist. 
Environment 
Monitoring 
Committee vs 
District Collector & 
ors 

Adv.  Vijay 
Panjwani 

07.04.2015- impleaded 
CPCB as Respondent 
and directed CPCB to 
conduct inspection. 
CPCB filed its 
inspection Report. As 
per compliance of the 
Hon'ble Court order 
dated 04.12.2017, 
CPCB filed its latest 
compliance Report on 
15.02.2018 with 
inspection of 
remaining 8th CETP. 

Reply filed. 
Listed              
on 09.10.2018 

10.  Civil Appeal No. 
1657 of 2018 
(Bharat 
Jhunjhunwala Vs 
Pushp Saini & Ors.) 

Adv. Suarabh 
Mishra  

I/c WQM-I 

This is Civil Appeal 
Against NGT (PB) 
Order dated 09.08.17. 
Matter is related to 
maintaining of 
minimum 
Environment flow in 
river Ganga in lean 
season . Reply sent to 
Advocate on 13.04.18 
for filing. 

Reply filed. 
Listed              
on 10.10.2018 

11.  Civil Appeal No. 
9509 of 2017, M/s 
PMV Maltings Pvt. 
Ltd. Vs The 
Uttrakhand 
Environment 
Protection & 
Pollution Control 
Board & Ors. 
(Respondent No. 2) 

Adv. 
Ghanshyam 

Joshi 
I/c WQM-II 

The matter is related 
malt industry, which 
falls under the 
category of Agro based. 
Appeal against the 
NGT Order. 

Reply filed. 
Listed              
on 12.10.2018 

12.  Civil Appeal No. 
5780 of 2018 (V. 
Ramasubbu Vs 
Union of India & 
Ors.) 

Adv. Aruna 
Mathur 

I/c IPC-II 
:Energy 

Metallurgical 

This Civil Appeal is 
filed against the final 
order & Judgement 
dated 08.09.2017in 
O.A. No. 158 of 2017 
Passed by NGT (SZ), at 
Chennai. This Civil 
Appeal is related to 
dumping of Copper 
slag in water spread 
area & buffer zone of 
upper Odai Stream in 
Puthukottai, Town 
Panchayat, Tuticorin 
District, Tamil Nadu. 
 

Reply filed. 
Listed              
on 12.10.2018 



National Green Tribunal ( 60 Cases) 

13.  OA NO.33/2013 
(THC) 
Karnail Singh 
Vs. 
CPCB &Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
IPC-SSI 

I/c (Dr.D.S. 
Kharat 

Related to mining in 
State of Punjab. 
CPCB has to 
conducted inspection 
of two weeks 
 

CPCB reply 
already filed. 
 
Inspection report 
of 87 industries 
ready to be file. 
 
Listed on 
01.10.2018 

14.  OA NO. 
30/2013(THC) 
Jai Singh 
Vs. 
U.O.I. &Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
IPC-SSI 

I/c (Dr. D.S. 
Kharat) 

Related to mining in 
State of Punjab.  
 

Inspection report 
of 87 industries 
ready to be file. 
 
Listed on 
01.10.2018 

15.  OA No. 644/2016 
Sushil Raghav & 
Anr. 
Vs. 
Union of India 
&Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
WQM-I 

(I/c Shri R.M. 
Bhardwaj) 

Related to discharge of 
untreated sewage & 
industrial effluent in 
Sahibabad drain in 
Eastern Yamuna canal 
ultimately polluting 
River Yamuna. 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
15.11.2016. 
 
 
 
Listed on 
01.10.2018 

16.  OA No. 400/2017 
Westend Green 
Farms Society 
Vs.  
Union of India & 
Ors. 

Adv. Satish 
Kumar 
IPC-IV 

(I/c Shri NK 
Gupta) 

Related to discharge of 
untreated sewage by 
18 various 
restaurants/ 
Hotels/Motels/Banque
t. 

Reply has been 
filed. 
 
Listed on 
01.10.2018 

17.  Original Application 
No. 409/2018 
Central Pollution 
Control Board Vs. 
Delhi Development 
Authority & Ors. 

Adv. Alpana 
Poddar 
UPC-I 

( I/c Shri 
Suneel Dave 

Related to C & D 
Waste 
Notice issued to the 
respondents. 
 

CPCB’s rejoinder 
has been filed. 
 
Listed on 
01.10.2018 

18.  Execution 
Application No. 
28/2018 
IN OA No. 261/2017 
Shikhar Stone 
Crusher 
vs. 
Central Pollution 
Control Board & 
Ors. 

Fresh Matter 
Listed for 

admission. 
IPC-V(SSI) 
(Shri D.S. 
Kharat) 

Execution copy not 
receives.   
Related to Stone 
Crusher, Saharanpur, 
U. P. 
 
 

Listed on 
01.10.2018 

19.  OA NO.613/2016 
Ram Niwas Goel vs 
Commissioner, East 
Delhi Municipal 
Corporation. 

Adv. RajKumar 
UPC-II 

Dr. S.K. Nigam 

Related to noise 
pollution & MSW 
Copy received on 
02.07.2018 

CPCB reply 
already filed  
Listed on 
01.10.2018 



20.  OA No. 46/2018 
Nuggehalli 
Jayasimha 
Vs.  
Govt. of NCT of 
Delhi 

Adv. Satish 
Kumar 
IPC-IV 

(N.K. Gupta) 
 

Related to Dairy Farms 
located in Delhi NCR. 
 

Joint Inspection 
report conducted 
by DPCC & CPCB 
filed on 
11.04.2018. 
Secretary Animal 
Husbandry to be 
present. 
Listed on 
03.10.2018 

21.  OA No.102/2018 
Nagavelli 
Rajalingamurth 
VS.  
Singareni Collieries 
Company Ltd. & 
ors. 

Adv. Balendu 
Shekhar 

IPC-II 
(Shri Nazim) 

Related to coal mining 
in Bhupalpally District 
of Telangana. 
 

CPCB reply filed 
on 12.04.2018 
 
Listed 
03.10.2018 

22.  OA No.361/2017 
Court on its own 
motion vs. Ministry 
of Environment & 
Forests & Climate 
Change & ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
I/c WQM-II 
(Shri. A. K. 
Vidhyarti) 

 

Copy of OA not 
received. 
CPCB has been 
impleaded as the party 
by the direction of the 
court. 

Inspection report 
has been filed. 
 
Reply is filed. 
Listed on 
03.10.2018 

23.  OA No. 723/2017 
Prakash Nidhi 
Sharma 
Vs. 
UOI &Ors. 

Adv. R. N. 
Singh 

IPC-V(SSI) 
(Shri Dr. D.S. 

Kharat) 

Related to tyre 
paralysis oil units 
operating in different 
states of India without 
NOC from SPCB. 

CPCB Reply filed 
on 17.01.2018. 
 
Listed on 
03.10.2018 

24.  Appeal No.18/2018  
IVL Dhunseri 
Petrochem 
Industries Pvt. Ltd.  
Vs.  
CPCB & Ors. 

Adv. Shlok 
Chandra 
WQM-II 

(Shri A.K. 
Vidyarthi) 

Related to Quashing of 
closure 
direction given by 
CPCB dated 
23/29.01.2018 U/S E 
(P) Act, 1986. 
 

CPCB Reply filed 
on 15.03.2018. 
CPCB Inspection 
report filed on 
21.03.2018 
 
Joint inspection 
report filed on 
19.05.2018. 
 
Appellant has to 
file objections to 
joint inspection 
report. 
Listed on 
03.10.2018 

25.  OA NO.126/2017 
Vikrant Tongad Vs. 
UOI &ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
WQM 

(Shri R.M. 
Bhardwaj) 

Related to cleaning up 
of canal in Dallupura 
in East Delhi. 
 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
27.07.2017. 
 
Listed on 
03.10.2018 



26.  Original Application 
No. 211/2018 
(Earlier O.A. No. 
22/2017 (SZ) 
Navroz Mody Vs. 
Union of India & 
Ors. 

Adv. Balendu 
Shekar 
WM-I 

(I/c Shri B. 
Vinod Babu) 
Transferred 

matter 
(Southern 

Zone) 

Listed for direction. 
 

The matter will 
be heard through 
Video 
Conferencing, as 
this matter 
relates to 
Southern Zonal 
Bench of NGT. 
 
Reply has been 
filed. 
 
Listed 
04.10.2018 

27.  OA No. 363/2018 
Gujarat Tanners v. 
UPPCB &Anr. 

Adv. 
SharmilaUpad

haya 
WQM-II 

(I/c Shri A.K. 
Vidhyarthi) 

Related to Tannery 
industry in Jajmau, 
Kanpur. 
 

Reply of 
objection   filed. 
Joint inspection to 
be carry out 
within three weeks 
by UPPCB & 
CPCBafter 
04.09.2018. 
 
Listed on 
04.10.2018 

28.  OA NO. 90/2017 
Safal Bharat Guru 
Parampara &Ors. 

Vs. 
State of Punjab 
&Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
IPC-SSI 

 (Shri Abhey 
Singh) 

Related to Plywood 
Industry in the State of 
Punjab. 
 

CPCB reply is 
already filed. 
Listed on 
04.10.2018 

29.  Suo Moto 
Application No. 
125/2017 
Court on its own 
Motion 
Vs. 
State of Karnataka 

Adv. Rajkumar 
WQM-I 

(I/c Shri R.M. 
Bhardwaj) 

Related to Bellandur 
Lake Fire in Bangalore 
city. 
 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
23.03.2017. 
 
Report will be 
filed by 
Karnataka State 
Pollution Control 
Board. 
 
 
Listed on 
04.10.2018 

30.  MA No. 1540/2017 
IN OA No. 255/2016 
Amarjeet Singh vs.  
State of 
Uttarakhand&Ors. 

Adv. Satish 
Kumar 

IPC-V(SSI) 
(Shri D.S. 
Kharat) 

Related to mining. 
MA filed by Applicant 
for the restoration of 
Original Application. 
 

CPCB reply 
already filed. 
 
Listed on 
04.10.2018 



31.  OA NO.54/2016 
Suryajyoti Singh 
Paul 
Vs. 
Union of India & 
Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
WM-I 

(I/c Shri B. 
Vinod Babu) 

Related to disposal of 
Bio-medical waste. 
 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
10.05.2016. 
 
Listed on 
04.10.2018 

32.  OA No. 380/2018 
Park Avenue Plot 
Holders Welfare 
Society &Anr. Vs. 
UOI & Ors. 
 

Fresh matter Copy of OA not 
received. 
Related to illegal 
construction. 

Listed on 
05.10.2018 

33.  OA No. 183/2018 
Subhash v. MoEF & 
Ors. 

CPCB is not 
party 

respondent. 

Related to illegal 
flyover in Baghpat 
District, U.P. 
 

Inspection report 
has been filed. 
Listed on 
05.10.2018 

34.  OA No. 81/2018 
Raghunath Singh  
Vs.  
UOI& Ors. 

Adv. Balendu 
Shekhar 

IPC-I 
(I/c Shri 

Gurnam Singh) 

Related to the Air, 
Noise and Water 
pollution caused by 
the illegal discharge of 
toxic chemical waste 
by color paint 
industries in the 
village of Chirhada, 
Haryana. 

CPCB reply filed 
on 04.04.2018 
CPCB is directed 
to inspect the 
units (Respondent 
No. 9 and 10) with 
regard to ambient 
air quality, ground 
water 
contamination, 
noise pollution 
and hazardous 
waste discharge 
within three weeks 
Listed on 
05.10.2018 

35.  OA NO. 473/2017 
Niharika 
Vs. 
Union of India & 
Ors. 

Adv. Sharmila 
Upadhaya 

WM-III 
(I/c Sh. Anand 

Kumar) 
 

Related to Technology 
using in Solar Panels 
in India. 
CPCB reply already 
filed on 24.08.2017 
Interim Report 
regarding antimony 
handed over to 
Counsel for filing on 
16.04.2018 

Final report of 
CPCB has been 
filed on 
06.07.2018 
"A report of WHO 
on Antimony 
standard is 
given at 
Annexure-I." but 
no such annexure 
is attached along 
with the report. 
Listed on 
05.10.2018 

36.  OA No. 332/2017 
Tejinder Jolly & 
Anr. Vs State of 
Uttrakhand & Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
IPC-V-SSI  

(D.S. Kharat) 

Related to stone 
crusher unit.  

CPC report has 
been filed. 
 
Listed on 
05.10.2018 



37.  OA NO.171/2013 
NGT Bar 
Association  
Vs. 
MoEF& Ors. 

Adv. Alpana 
Poddar 
PCI-SSI 

(I/c Shri D.S 
Kharat) 

Related to illegal river 
sand mining without 
Environmental 
Clearance on 
bordering area of 
Haryana & U.P. 
 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
29.08.2013. 
 
Listed on 
05.10.2018 

38.  OA NO. 418/2015 
Ferozpur Welfare 
Society (Regd.) Vs. 
State of Haryana 
&Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
IPC-SSI 

(I/c Shri D.S. 
Kharat) 

Unauthorized polluting 
industries setup in the 
agricultural land, 
causing damage to the 
crops, drains water by 
hazardous chemicals 
waste. 
 

CPCB reply 
already   filed on 
15.12.2015. 
 
Listed on 
08.10.2018 

39.  OA No. 351/2018 
Jharsuguda 
Banchao Samiti Vs. 
Ministry of 
Environment and 
Forest & Ors 

AdvShlok 
Chandra 

IPC-II 
(I/c 

Shri.Nazim) 
(Adv. Shlok) 

Related to Thermal 
Power Plant. 
 

Reply filed. 
 
Listed on 
08.10.2018 

40.  OA No.337/2018 
K. Hiroji Rao Vs. 
UOI &ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
I/c IPC-V-SSI 

(Shri. D.S. 
Kharat) 

Related to Stone 
Crusher Unit. 

Join inspection 
report and reply 
has been filed. 
 
Final report has 
been filed. 
 
Listed on 
08.10.2018 

41.  OA No. 776/2017 
Ashwini Kumar 
&Anr.  
VS.  
CPCB &Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
IPC-III 

(I/c Shri PK 
Mishra) 

 

Copy of MA is received. 
MA filed by M/s 
Meenu Papers Ltd. 
 

Inspection 
Report filed on 
07.03.2018 
 
Listed on 
08.10.2018 

42.  OA NO. 500/2016 
Krishan Kumar 
Vs. Chief Secretary, 
Govt. Of NCT of 
Delhi &Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
IPC-SSI 

(Shri D.S. 
Kharat) 

Related to illegal 
workshops running in 
Residential Area in 
East Delhi. 
 

Survey has been 
completed by the 
Joint Inspection 
team of DPCC, 
CPCB & NDMC. 
Report already 
filed by DPCC. 
 
Listed on 
08.10.2018 



43.  OA No. 681/2017 
Gauri Maulekhi Vs 
Union of India 
&Ors. 

Adv. R.N. 
Singh 

IPC-V(SSI) 
(I/c Shri D.S. 

Kharat) 

Related to 
indiscriminate disposal 
of waste and 
distribution and 
administration of 
antibiotics by the 
poultry farms. 
Adjourned for the next 
date of hearing. 

CPCB reply 
already   filed on 
10.01.2018. 
 
Listed on 
08.10.2018 

44.  OA NO.822/2017 
Mahesh Chandra 
Sharma vs. UOI & 
ors. 

Adv. Satish 
Kumar 
WM-I 

(I/c B. Vinod 
Babu) 

Related to continuous 
illegal construction 
and setting up of a 
Biomedical Waste 
Processing Plant in 
Etmadpur Tehsil, 
District Agra. 
 

Reply has been 
filed on 
08.02.2018. 
 
 
Listed on 
08.10.2018 

45.  OA No. 187/2017 
Ridhima Pandey Vs. 
UOI & Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
UPC-I 

(I/C Sh. 
Suneel Dave) 

Related to adverse 
impact of climate 
change. 
 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
04.05.2017. 
 
Listed on 
09.10.2018 
 

46.  OA NO. 509/2015  
Saloni Alaiwadi Vs.  
UOI & Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
UPC-I 

(I/c Shri 
Suneel Dave) 

Related to cheat 
devices installed in the 
Diesel car by the 
manufactures.   
 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
17.02.2016. 
 
Listed on 
09.10.2018 

47.  OA No. 527/2015 
Satwinder Singh 
Sodhi 
Vs. 
Volkswagan (I) Pvt. 
Ltd. & Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
UPC-I 

(I/c Shri 
Suneel Dave) 

Related to cheat 
devices installed in the 
Diesel cars by the 
manufacturers. 
 
 

CPCB reply 
already   filed on 
17.02.2016 
 
Listed on 
09.10.2018 

48.  OA NO.134/2015 
Friends through its 
General Secretary 
Vs. Ministry of 
Water Resources 
&Ors. 

Adv. 
AlpanaPoddar 

WQM-I 
(I/C Shri R.M. 

Bhardwaj) 

Related to ground 
water pollution. 
CPCB report on Water 
Quality supplying in 
Delhi is filed. 
 

CPCB reply 
already filed. 
CPCB reply in MA 
NO. 757/2015 is 
filed. 
 
Listed on 
09.10.2018 
 



49.  OA No.279/2018 
Jitendra Yadav Vs. 
MoEF & CC 

Adv Shlok 
Chandra 
UPC-II 

(I/c Shri S.K. 
Nigam) 

Related to large scale 
pollution in District 
Gurugram by improper 
disposal of MSW and 
violation of provisions 
of SWM, Rules 2016, 
Bio-medical waste 
Rules, 2016, Plastic 
waste Management 
Rules, 2016. 
 

CPCB reply has 
been filed. 
 
 
 
Listed on 
09.10.2018 

50.  OA No.215/2016 
Central Pollution 
Control Board  
Vs. 
Chief Executive 
Officer, 4 
Municipalities U.P. 

Adv. Balendu 
Shekhar 
WQM-II 

(Shri A K 
Vidyarthi) 
(Filed by 
CPCB) 

Related to show cause 
notice for failure to 
comply with statutory 
and public law 
obligations and 
directions issued by 
the Central Board. 
 

Tribunal given 
last opportunity 
to file status 
report and reply 
of show cause 
before the next 
date of hearing 
to all the 
respondents. 
 
Listed on 
09.10.2018 

51.  OA NO.64/2016 
Gopeshwar Nath 
Chaturvedi 
Vs. 
U.P.P.C.B & Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
IPC-SSI 

(I/C Dr. D.S. 
Kharat) 

Related to industries 
operating illegally in 
the residential areas of 
the Mathura town. 
MA No.587/2018 
stands Disposed off. 
Adjournment for the 
next date of hearing. 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
23.03.2016. 
 
Listed on 
09.10.2018 

52.  OA No. 24/2018 
Shailesh Singh 
vs. State of UP 
&Ors. 

Adv R.N Singh 
WQM-II 

(I/c Shri R.M. 
Bhardwaj) 

Related to the 
condition of River 
Gomti which has 
become polluted due to 
poor drainage system 
and severe water 
logging in the capital of 
U.P.  
 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
8.03.2018. 
 
Listed on 
10.10.2018 

53.  Appeal No. 48/2018 
Haribhan & Anr. Vs 
UOI & Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
IPC-II 

Shri Nazim 

Related to non-coal 
mining. 
 

CPCB reply has 
been filed. 
 
Listed on 
10.10.2018 

54.  OA NO. 433/2017  
Shibani Ghosh 
Vs. 
MoEF& CC & Ors. 

Adv R.N.                               
Singh 
AQM 

(I/c Sh. 
Prashant 
Gargava) 

Related to air pollution 
& air pollutants 
emitted by the ships 
entering Indian waters.     
 

CPCB reply            
filed on 
10.10.2017. 
 
Listed on 
10.10.2018 



55.  OA No.824/2017 
Dharam Singh &ors. 
Vs. Venco Research  
 

Adv. R. N. 
Singh 
IPC-V 

(I/c Sh. D.S. 
Kharat) 

Related to the 
establishment of new 
poultry farm by Venco 
Research R-1 in the 
residential area in 
village Rampur, U.P. 

Reply filed on 
16.02.2018. 
 
Listed on 
10.10.2018 

56.  OA NO. 311/2015 
Devendra Singh 
Bholey 
Vs.  
UOI &Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
IPC-III 

 (I/C Shri P.K. 
Mishra) 

Related to Paper 
Industry. 
Adjourned for the next 
date of hearing. 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
15.09.2017. 
 
Listed on 
10.10.2018 

57.  OA NO.15/2014 
Him 
JagritiUttranchal 
Welfare Society vs. 
UOI &Ors. 

Adv. 
AlpanaPoddar 

UPC-II 
(Dr. S.K. 
Nigam) 

Related to plastic 
waste management. 
 

CPCB reply 
already   filed on 
02.04.2014 
 
Listed on 
10.10.2018  

58.  OA No. 368/2018 
Nilkanth Rajaram 
Raskar Vs. M/s. 
Saswad Mali Sugar 
Factory Ltd. & Ors 

Adv. 
Rajkumar 

 

Fresh matter Listed on 
10.10.2018 

59.  OA No. 317/2015 
Rashid Ali Warsi  
Vs. 
UPSIDC Ltd. & Ors. 
 

Adv. Rajkumar 
IPC-SSI 

(Shri  
(Shri D.S 
Kharat) 

 

Related to discharge of 
untreated waste in the 
village canal in Tronica 
City GZB U.P. 
Direction for CETPs to 
close down. 
Adjourned for the next 
date of hearing. 
 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
1.01.2016. 
 
Joint Inspection 
by UPPCB & 
CPCB carried 
out.  
 
Report is filed on 
23.03.2017. 
Listed on 
11.10.2018. 



60.  Appeal No.18/2018  
IVL Dhunseri 
Petrochem 
Industries Pvt. Ltd.  
Vs.  
CPCB & Ors. 

Adv. Shlok 
Chandra 
WQM-II 

(Shri A.K. 
Vidyarthi) 

Related to Quashing of 
closure 
direction given by 
CPCB dated 
23/29.01.2018 U/S E 
(P) Act, 1986. 
 

CPCB Reply filed 
on 15.03.2018. 
CPCB Inspection 
report filed on 
21.03.2018 
 
Joint inspection 
report filed on 
19.05.2018. 
 
Appellant has to 
file objections to 
joint inspection 
report. 
 
Listed on 
11.10.2018. 

61.  OA NO.483/2016 
Indian Council for 
Enviro Legal Action 
&Ors.  Vs. J & K 
State Pollution 
Control Board &Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
IPC V-SSI 
(I/c Sh. 

D.S.Kharat ) 

Pollution by the 
industries in Dist. 
Sambha, J&K. 
 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
24.10.2016 
 
Listed on 
11.10.2018. 

62.  OA NO. 117/2014 
Shantanu Sharma 
Vs. 
U.O.I. &Ors. 

Adv. Alok 
Kumar 
IPC-II 

(Shri Nazim) 

Related to proper 
utilization of Fly Ash 
generated by the Coal 
and Lignite based 
Thermal Power Plants 
with respect to the Fly 
Ash brick industry 
notifications issued by 
the MoEF& CC. 
 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
16.09.2017. 
 
 
Listed on 
11.10.2018. 

63.  Appeal No. 
112/2018 
University of Delhi 
Vs. MoEF &CC & 
Ors. 

Adv. Balendu 
Shekhar 

 (I/c UPC-I 
Sh. Suneel 

Dave) 
 

Related to construction 
of multi-storied 
apartment in north 
campus area. 

CPCB reply filed. 
Listed on 
11.10.2018. 

64.  OA No. 352/2018 
Shyam Sunder 
Joshi 
v. Union of India & 
Ors. 

Adv. Balendu 
UPC- II 

(Shri Suneel 
Dave) 

 

Related to 
contamination of 
drinking water by 
constructions of STP in 
Bareilly UP. 

CPCB reply filed. 
 
 
Listed on 
11.10.2018. 

65.  O.A. No. 613/2017 
Mohd.  Javed 
Asghar Vs. M/s. 
Upper Ganges 
Sugar and 
Industries (Distillery 
Unit) &Ors.  

Adv. Satish 
WQM-II 

(I/c Shri A.K. 
Vidyarthi) 

Related to untreated 
discharge of the open 
press mud  and ground 
water extraction due to 
the activity  
 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
23.02.2018 
 
Listed on 
11.10.2018. 



66.  O.A. No. 614/2017 
Mohd.  Javed 
Asghar Vs. State of 
UP & ors. 

Adv. Sharmila 
Uppadhyay 

WQM-II 
(I/c Shri A.K. 

Vidyarthi) 

Related to untreated 
discharge 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
23.02.2018 
 
Listed on 
11.10.2018. 

67.  OA No. 299/2018 
(Earlier OA No. 
148/2017 (EZ) 
Sai Sulphonates 
Pvt. Ltd. 
Vs. West Bengal 
Pollution Control 
Board &Ors.  

Adv Balendu 
Shekhar 

 

Transferred matter 
form eastern Zone.  
Copy of Application 
received. 
 

16.08.2018 
Listed on 
12.10.2018 
 

68.  OA NO.306/2016 
Social Action for 
Forest and 
Environment(SAFE) 
Vs. Union of India 
&Ors. (Earlier titled 
as D.K. Joshi Vs. 
Union of India & 
Ors. 

Adv. Rajkumar 
UPC-II 

(I/c Shri S.K. 
Nigam) 

Related to 
Management of Solid 
Waste in Taj 
Trapezium Zone (TTZ). 
 
 
 
 

CPCB reply 
already filed on 
30.09.2016. 
 
Listed on 
12.10.2018 
 

69.  OA No. 710/2017 
Shailesh Singh Vs.  
Sheela Hospital & 
Trauma Center, 
Shahjahanpur& 
Ors. 

Adv. Prakash 
Singh 

B. Vinod Babu 
(WM-I) 

Related to Bio Medical 
Waste drawn out from 
hospitals. 
 

CPCB reply 
already   filed on 
22.01.2018. 
 
Listed on 
12.10.2018 
 

70.  OA No. 711/2017 
Shailesh Singh  
Vs.  
Kailash Hospital 
and Heart Institute 
& Ors. 

Adv. Prakash 
Singh 

B. Vinod Babu 
(WM-I) 

Related to Bio Medical 
Waste drawn out from 
hospitals. 
 

CPCB reply 
already   filed on 
22.01.2018. 
 
Listed on 
12.10.2018 
 

71.  OA No. 712/2017 
Shailesh Singh Vs.  
Shri Ganga Charan 
Hospital Pvt. Ltd, 
Bareilly & Ors. 

Adv. Prakash 
Singh 

B. Vinod Babu 
(WM-I) 

Related to Bio Medical 
Waste drawn out from 
hospitals. 
 

CPCB reply 
already   filed on 
22.01.2018. 
 
Listed on 
12.10.2018 
 

72.  OA No. 713/2017 
Shailesh Singh Vs.  
Katiyar Nursing 
Home, Hardoi& Ors. 

Adv. Prakash 
Singh 

B. Vinod Babu 
(WM-I) 

Related to Bio Medical 
Waste drawn out from 
hospitals. 
 

CPCB reply 
already   filed on 
22.01.2018. 
 
Listed on 
12.10.2018 
 



NGT WESTERN BENCH, PUNE(15 CASES) 

73.  O.A. No. 
143/2016,WZ, 
Dileep B. Nivetia vs. 
Union of India & 
Ors. MA 377 of 
2016 

Adv Rahul 
Andhale 

AQM 
(I/c Shri. 
Prashant 
Gargava) 

Related to Indoor Air 
Pollution Quality & its 
Parameters.  

Reply  sent to 
R.D(V) for filing. 
Listed on 
01.10.2018 

74.  Appeal No. 
142(THC)of 2016, 
Sheikh Rashid 
Charitable 
Foundation,Malegao
n vs Union of India 
& Ors. 

Adv Rahul 
Andhale 

WM-I 
(Shri. Vinod 

Babu) 

Related to Municipal 
Solid Waste problem in 
Malegaon. 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
01.10.2018 

75.  Execution 
Apllication NO 
61/2016 In 
Application No. 
81/2015 (Disposed 
on 30.08.2016) In 
Re: Dileep Nevatia 
Vs UoI & Ors 

Adv. Anirudha 
Kulkarni    
IPC-VI 

(I/c Shri. 
P.K.Gupta)      

Related to fixation of 
BIS Standards for 
Kerosene. 

Listed on 
01.10.2018 

76.  Application No. 
106(THC) OF 2017 
(Sanjay 
AnnajiJiwane v 
State of 
Maharashtra.  

Adv Rahul 
Andhale 

WM-I 
(I/c Shri.Vinod 

Babu)      

Regarding 
transportation of 
Hazardous Waste. 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
01.10.2018 

77.  Execution 
Application 
no.03/2017 in 
Application no 
39/2013.  

Adv. Anirudha 
Kulkarni    

UPC-I 
(I/c Shri. 

Suneel Dave) 

Related to development 
of Noise Standards for 
Automobile and 
Standards for Horn on 
Road.  

Reply Filed. 
Listed on 
01.10.2018 

78.  OA No.01/2018 
Vanashakti Vs 
MPCB & Ors 

IPC-V(SSI) 
(I/c Shri. 

D.S.Kharat) 

Related to Brick Kilns, Annexures not 
received 
Listed on 
03.10.2018 

79.  Appeal No 47 of 
2018 Jagannath 
Pandurang Sinnari 
Vs Maharashtra 
PCB 

Adv. Anirudha 
Kulkarni 

IPC-II(I/c Shri. 
Nazimuddin) 

Related to issue 
regarding grant of 
consent for quarrying 
in Sindhudurg district, 
Maharashtra. 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
04.10.2018 

80.  EA No.24/2017 
Dileep Nivetia Vs 
UOI 

Adv. Anirudha 
Kulkarni 

UPC-I(I/c Shri. 
Suneel Dave) 

Related to 
Development of Noise 
Standards for 
Automobile and 
Standards for Horn on 
Road. 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
04.10.2018 



81.  Application 
128/2017(WZ) 
Kanabhai Sevra & 
Ors. V/s The CPCB 
& Ors. 

Adv Rahul 
Andhale 
IPC-III 

(I/c Shri 
P.K.Mishra) 

Related to Pollution 
due to resp.no.8 
(Industry Junagadh 
District, Gujarat), 
groundwater pollution, 
affecting soil fertility, 
productivity etc. 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
05.10.2018 

82.  Application 
No.114/2015 
Protection of 
Environment & 
Public Service 
Committee Vs 
Indian Rayon & Ors 

Adv Rahul 
Andhale 

IPC-I 
(I/c 

Shri.Gurnam 
Singh)      

Related to Pollution 
due M/s Indian rayon 
& EC related issues 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
05.10.2018 

83.  OA No.35/2018 
Jijab Salunkhe & 
Anr. Vs Shree 
Bhimseshwari Ispat 
Pvt.Ltd. 

Adv. Anirudha 
Kulkarni 

IPC-V SSI(I/c 
Shri. 

D.S.Kharat) 

Related to air pollution 
caused by M/s 
Bhimeshwari Ispat 
Pvt.Ltd. 
 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
05.10.2018 

84.  O.A . No 148 of 
2017 Vide O.dt 
27.07.17 in 
Application No.37 of 
2013, disposed 
02.07.2015 OLD No. 
M.A No. 239/2017 
Dombivili CETP in 
the matter of 
Vanashakti Public 
trust Vs MPCB & 
Ors 

Adv. Anirudha 
Kulkarni 
IPC-VII 

(I/c Shri. Ajay 
Aggarwal)      

 

CETP’s issue in 
Dombivali and 
Ambernath Area.  

Quarterly Report 
from April to 
June 2018 
submitted in 
Tribunal. 
 
Listed on 
08.10.2018 

85.  OA NO. 2/2017 
Tarun Patel Vs 
MoEF & CC & Ors. 

Adv Rahul 
Andhale 
IPC-VII 

(I/c Shri. Ajay 
Aggarwal)      

 

Regarding 
reassessment of MoEF 
& CC Notification 
dated 01st January, 
2016 for removing 
scientific flaws and 
anomalies in achieving 
the objects of 
Environment Act 1986 
and Water Act, 1974.  

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
10.10.2018 

86.  OA No. 99/2017, 
Tarun Patel Vs 
MoEF& CC & Ors 

Adv Rahul 
Andhale 
IPC-VII 

(I/c Shri. Ajay 
Aggarwal)      

 

Related to betterment 
of environment in the 
Coastal Sea shore area 
and connecting 
estuaries' from 
Tadgam beach to 
Tithal beach of Bulsar 
district along with the 
Jampore and Devka 
beach of Daman. 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
10.10.2018 



87.  O.A. 20/2017 
Babubhai 
Ramubhai Saini Vs. 
GPCB & Ors. O.A. 
42/2017 Babubhai 
Ramubhai Saini Vs. 
GPCB & Ors. 

Adv Rahul 
Andhale 

IPC-V(SSI) 
(I/c Shri. 

D.S.Kharat) 

Related to pollution 
and issues of Gasifiers 
at Ceramic industries 
in Morbi-Wankaner 
Area, Gujarat. 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
11.10.2018 

NGT CENTRAL BENCH, BHOPAL (01 CASE) 

88.  Application 
no.139/13, Akhil 
Bhartiya Vidyarthi 
Parisad & Ors. Vs 
Union of India & 
Ors. 

Adv Yadvendra 
Yadav 
WQM-I          

(I/c Shri.A. 
Sudhakar 

Regarding Pollution in 
River Narmada 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
11.10.2018 

NGT EASTERN BENCH, KOLKATA(10 CASES) 

89.  O.A. No. 474/2018 
(Earlier/ Origanally 
O.A. No. 
30/2014/EZ) 
Joydeep Mukherjee 
Vs Chief Secretary 
of WB & Ors. 

Adv Surender 
Kumar 
WQM-I          

(I/c Shri.A. 
Sudhakar) 

 

Related to pollution of 
Tarapith Temple & 
Hotels 

The matter will be 
heard through 
video conferencing 
by Hon'ble 
NGT/PB/New 
Delhi. 
Reply        Filed 
Listed on 
01.10.2018 

90.  OA No.33/2014/EZ 
Subhash Dutta Vs 
State of WB & Ors 

Adv Surender 
Kumar 
AQM 

(I/c Shri. 
Prashant 
Gargava) 

 

Matter is related to Air 
pollution in the cities 
of Kolkata and 
Howrah. 

Heard through 
Video 
Conferencing. 
Reply        Filed 
Listed on 
01.10.2018 

91.  OA 
No.152/2017/EZ 
Legal Aid Services-
West Bengal Vs 
Union of India & ors 

Adv Surender 
Kumar 
IPC-II 

(I/c Shri. 
Nazimuddin) 

 

Related to DVC Mejia 
Thermal Power plant 
and its impact in the 
surrounding villages 
due to fly ash. 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
01.10.2018 

92.  O.A. No. 
12/2017/EZ Dinkar 
Bricks Vs. Union of 
india & ors. 

Adv Surender 
Kumar 

IPC-V SSI               
(I/c Shri. 

D.S.Kharat) 

Related to pollution 
caused due to bricks & 
ec of brick kiln. 

Reply Filed. 
Listed on 
04.10.2018 

93.  O.A No. 
114/2015/EZ 
Subrato Mookerjee 
vs GM,Kolaghat 
Thermal Power 
Station & Ors. 

Adv Surender 
Kumar 
IPC-II          

(I/c Shri. 
Nazimuddin) 

 

The matter is 
pertaining to the stack 
emission from 
Kolaghat Thermal 
Power Plant, Kolaghat 
(W.B). 
 
 

Reply Filed. 
Listed on 
05.10.2018 



94.  O.A. No. 
471/2018/PB 
(Earlier / Origanally 
O.A. No. 
15/2014/EZ) 
Tribunal on its own 
Motion Vs Union of 
India & Ors 

Adv Surender 
Kumar 
WQM-I          

(I/c Shri.A. 
Sudhakar) 

 

Related to pollution of 
River Churni. 

Heard through 
Video 
Conferencing. 
Reply         Filed 
Listed on 
09.10.2018 

95.  O.A. No. 
24/2018/EZ 
(Ambarnath 
Sengupta Vs State 
of West Bengal & 
Ors.) 

Adv Surender 
Kumar 
WQM-I          

(I/c Shri.A. 
Sudhakar) 

 

Related to water 
pollution due to 
immersion of idol. 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
09.10.2018 

96.  133/2017 
(Murlidhar Ratanlal 
Export Ltd Vs. 
CPCB & Ors. 

Adv Surender 
Kumar 
WQM-II   

(I/c  Shri.    
A.K. Vidyarthi)        

Related to discharge of 
trade effluents in river 
from the jute Textiles 
Mill. 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
10.10.2018 

97.  O.A No. 139 OF 
2017 (Kan kana Das 
Vs. Union of India & 
Ors.) 

Adv Surender 
Kumar 
WM-I  

(I/c Shri. 
Vinod Babu)        

Related to the 
pollution cause by 
biomedical waste. 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
10.10.2018 

98.  OA No.70 of 2016 
(EZ) Tribunal on its 
Motion Vs State of 
West Bengal & ors. 

Adv Surender 
Kumar 
UPC-I  

(I/c Shri. 
Suneel Dave)      

Regarding dumping of 
Garbage at Rajiv Nagar 
North, 24-Pargaanas, 
West Bengal 

Reply Filed.         
Listed on 
11.10.2018 

NGT SOUTHERN BENCH, CHENNAI(16 CASES) 

99.  OA no. 213 of 2015 
C.P. Senthil Vs 
TNPCB & 2 ors. 
CPCB is not 
respondent party. 

Adv D. 
Ekambaram 

WQM-I          
(I/c Shri.A. 
Sudhakar) 

 

Related to improper 
function of STP at 
Globus Gardens, 
Coimbatore. 

Report 
Submitted. Listed 
on 03.10.2018 

100.  MA no. 15 of 2017 
filed in OA no. 195 
of 2016 Tandur 
Citizens Welfare 
Society Vs Govt. of 
Telangana & Ors  

Adv D. 
Ekambaram 

IPC-II          
(I/c Shri. 

Nazimuddin) 
 
 

Related to Pollution 
problem created by the 
cement industries 
located in Tandur, 
Ranga Reddy DIstirct, 
Telengana 

Reply        Filed.                 
Listed on 
03.10.2018 

101.  Appeal Nos 51-52 of 
2017 Manali 
Petrochemicals Ltd 
Plant I & II Vs CPCB 

Adv D. 
Ekambaram 

IPC-I 
(I/c Shri. 

Gurnam Singh) 
 

Regarding pollution 
caused due to effluent 
discharge to Marine 
source by M/s MPL –I 
& II. 

Reply        Filed.                 
Listed on 
03.10.2018 



102.  OA no.43 of 2017 
Suo Moto Case by 
Tribunal Vs State of 
Kerala & 9 Ors 

Adv. 
Thirunavukars

u 
WM-I 

(I/c Shri. 
Vinod Babu) 

Related to Bio Medical 
Waste 

Reply        Filed.                 
Listed on 
05.10.2018 

103.  OA no. 59 of 2017 
Devi Social & 
Educational 
Foundation Vs 
Director, General of 
Hydrocarbons & 8 
Ors 

CPCB has filed 
the case 

against eight 
industries on 
violation of 

closure 
directions 

issued under 
E(P) Act, 1986 

Regarding 
Environmental 
Damage caused due to 
extraction and 
exploration of 
Hydrocarbons in 
Puddukkottai Distirct, 
Tamil Nadu. 

Reply        Filed.                 
Listed on 
05.10.2018 

104.  Original Application 
No. 37 of 2012 Sri 
S.P.Surendranath 
Kathik Vs 
Chairman, 
Pallavaram 
Municipality & Ors.  

Adv D. 
Ekambaram 

UPC-II 
(I/c Shri.S.K. 

Nigam) 
 

Related to Municipal 
Solid Waste dumpsite. 

Reply        Filed.                 
Listed on 
05.10.2018 

105.  Appln. No 77 of 
2016 Smt. Padma 
Kodali Vs Karnataka 
State Pollution 
Control Board & 
Ors. 

Adv D. 
Ekambaram 

IPC-II          
(I/c Shri. 

Nazimuddin) 
 

Regarding pollution 
caused due to sponge 
iron industries, 
Bellary. 

Reply        Filed.                 
Listed on 
08.10.2018 

106.  OA No.14 of 2017 
Meenavar Nala 
Sangam Vs The 
Chairman, National 
Coastal Zone 
Management 
Authority, GOI & 
Ors. 

Adv D. 
Ekambaram 

WQM-I          
(I/c Shri.A. 
Sudhakar) 

 

Regarding Pollution 
caused due to Oil Spill 
from the collision of 
two ships near 
Kamarajar Port, 
Chennai. 

Reply        Filed.                 
Listed on 
08.10.2018 

107.  136 of 2016 in the 
matter of Capt. 
B.S.Prakash Vs 
Union of India & 6 
ors. CPCB is 3rd 
respondent 
renumbered as 276 
of 2017 

Adv D. 
Ekambaram 

IPC-VII 
(I/c Shri. Ajay 

Aggarwal) 

The matter is 
regarding violating the 
terms & conditions 
granted in 
Environmental 
clearance by M/s 
Green Gateway leisure 
Limited, 
Thiruvananthapuram, 
Kerala. 

Reply        Filed.                 
Listed on 
08.10.2018 



108.  OA 337 of 2018 ( 
through video 
conference) K.Hiroji 
Rao Vs Union of 
India & Ors (CPCB 
is Respondent No.2) 

Adv.Thiruvana
karasu 

IPC-V SSI               
(I/c Shri. 

D.S.Kharat) 

Regarding joint 
inspection done with 
APPCB for 22 stone 
crusher units and 
related mining areas.  

CPCB is directed 
to serve the copy 
of report to all the 
parties in 
proceedings. 
Listed on 
08.10.2018 

109.  Application No 165 
Of 2017 Meena 
Thanthai K.R. 
Selvaraj Kumar 
Meenavar Nala 
Sangam Vs The 
Secretary to 
Government UOI & 
9 Ors. Respondent 
No 04. 

Adv. K. 
Prabhakar 

IPC-VII 
(I/c Shri. Ajay 

Aggarwal) 
 

Regarding Crude Oil 
Pipeline without any 
coating inside the 
pipeline is gross 
violation of the specific 
conditions of the CRZ 
clearance.  

Reply        Filed.                 
Listed on 
09.10.2018 

110.  Application No 
170/2017 K. Sathis 
Goud & 3 others Vs 
State of Telangana 
& 6 other. 
Respondant-6 

Adv D. 
Ekambaram 

UPC-I  
(I/c Shri. 

Suneel Dave) 

Regarding Protest 
causing Noise 
Pollution, & removal of 
Loudspeakers. Prevent 
vehicular movement 
causing air pollution.  

Reply        Filed.                 
Listed on 
09.10.2018 

111.  O.A. No 123 of 2017 
(Dr.Krithika 
Gokulnath Vs 
Registrar & Ors.) 
(CPCB respondent 
No. 4) 

Adv. 
P.Jaylaxmi. 

WM-I 
(I/c Shri. 

Vinod Babu) 

Regarding Biomedical 
waste issue (I/C-Shri 
Vinod Babu) 

Reply        Filed.                 
Listed on 
10.10.2018 

112.  Application No. 277 
of 2017. In the 
matter of Meenava 
Thanthai K. R. 
Selvaraj Kumar Vs 
Union of India & 11 
Ors. CPCB os 
respondent No. 4 

Adv. 
P.Jaylaxmi. 

IPC-VII 
(I/c Shri. Ajay 

Aggarwal) 
 

Regarding violation of 
EC conditions by M/s 
CPCL. 

Reply        Filed.                 
Listed on 
10.10.2018 

113.  OA no. 81 of 2017 
Puducherry 
Environment 
Protection 
Association Vs 
CPCB 

Adv T 
N.C.Kaushik 

IPC-VI 
(Shri. 

P.K.Gupta) 

Regarding challenging 
the CPCB letter dated 
2nd February, 2017 on 
grant of Consent. 

Reply      Filed.                 
Listed on 
10.10.2018 

114.  Application No.256 
of 2017 (SZ) Central 
Pollution Control 
Board Vs M/s. 
Shree 
Halasiddanath SSK 
Ltd and 19 ors 

Adv D. 
Ekambaram 

IPC-I 
(I/c Shri. 

Gurnam Singh) 
 

CPCB has filed the 
case against eight 
industries on violation 
of closure directions 
issued under E(P) Act, 
1986 

Notice to 
respondents 
served. 
Reply      Filed.                 
Listed on 
12.10.2018 

JAMMU & KASHMIR HIGH COURT( 01 CASE) 



115.  W.PIL. No. 42/2014. 
Rajinder Singh Vs 
State & ors.  

Adv Dheeraj 
Sharma 
UPC-II 

(I/c Shri.S.K. 
Nigam) 

Related to Ambient Air 
Quality Monitoring 
Stations in Jammu & 
Kashmir. 

Reply sent to 
R.D(Lucknow). 
Listed on 
03.10.2018 
 

UTTRAKHAND HIGH COURT(01 CASE) 

116.  WPPIL No.77/2017 
Himanshu 
Chandola vs State of 
Uttarakhand & Ors 

Adv Rajeev 
Bhatt 

WQM-II 
(I/c Shri. A.K. 

Vidyarthi) 

CPCB has to inspect 
the industries of 
Rudrapur. 

Inspection 
Report of 160 
industries 
handed over to 
advocate for 
submitting in 
court. 
Listed on 
04.10.2018 

Delhi High Court (  01 Case) 

117.  WP(C) 841/1998 
Ashok Agarwal Vs.  
UOI & Ors. 
 

Adv. Alapana 
Poddar 
(UPC-II) 
Shri S.K. 

Nigam 

Related to Municipal 
Solid waste in 
Country. 
 
 

CPCB has filed 
periodic report 
on solid waste 
Management. 
 
Listed on 
03.10.2018 

BOMBAY HIGH COURT(01 CASE) 

118.  Writ Petitions No. 
2380,2381,2382,23

83,2661,2879, 
3162,3348,3546,35

48,3549,3550, 
3551,3597,7214,84

46,8503,8505, 
8507,8510,8512,85
15,8602 &    8614 

of 2018 
 

Adv C.M. 
Lokeshappa 

IPC-III 
(Shri.P.K. 
Gupta) 

Related  to Saw Mill Reply      Filed.                 
Listed on 
12.10.2018 

 

 

 

 

 



 
 

Law Division  
01st October, to 12th October 2018 

Supreme Court of India, NGT, PB, New Delhi & Delhi High Court 
 

S 
No. 

Name of Court No. of 
Cases 

Action to be taken 
/Important Case 

Remarks 

1. Supreme Court of 
India 

12 No action required. No action required. 

2. NGT-Principal 
Bench, New Delhi 

60 Action required by 
Law Division 

(NGT,PB) in 02 Cases 

Reply already filed in All other 
cases. 

3. Delhi High court 01 No action required. No action required. 

4. NGT Western 
Bench, Pune 

15 No action required Reply Filed in other cases. 

5. NGT Central 
Bench, Bhopal 

01 No action required Reply Filed 

6. NGT Eastern 
Bench, Kolkata 

10 No action required Reply Filed 

7. NGT Southern 
Bench, Chennai 

16 No action required Reply Filed 

8. Bombay High 
Court 

01 No action required Reply Filed 

9. Jammu & 
Kashmir High 

Court 

01 No action required Reply Filed 

10. Uttrakhand High 
Court 

01 No action required Reply Filed 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Scheduled for Hearing in Date Wise 
 

S 
No. 

Date  No. of 
cases  

Courts/Tribunal 

1 01st October, 2018 18 NGT, Principal Bench, New Delhi, (07 Cases), NGT 
Western Zone, Pune(05 Cases) NGT Eastern 
Zone, Kolkata(03 Cases), NGT Southern Zone, 
Chennai(03 Cases)  

2 02nd October, 
2018 

 HOLIDAY 

3 03rd October, 2018 12 Supreme Court of India, ( 03 Case), NGT, Principal 
Bench, New Delhi, (06 Cases), Delhi High Court (01 
case), NGT Western Zone, Pune(01 Case), J & K 
High Court(01 Case) 

4 04th October, 2018 10 NGT, Principal Bench, New Delhi, (06 Cases), NGT 
Western Zone, Pune(02 Cases),  NGT Eastern 
Zone, Kolkata(01 Cases), Uttrakhand High 
Court(01 Case) 

5. 05th  October,2018 15 Supreme Court of India, (02 Cases), NGT, Principal 
Bench, New Delhi, (06 Cases), NGT Western Zone, 
Pune(03 Cases) NGT Eastern Zone, Kolkata(01 
Case), NGT Southern Zone, Chennai(03 Cases) 

6. 06th  October,2018 01 Supreme Court of India, (01 Case) 
7 08th October,2018 14 Supreme Court of India, (02 Cases)NGT, Principal 

Bench, New Delhi (07 Cases), NGT Western Zone, 
Pune(01 Case), NGT Southern Zone, Chennai(04 
Cases) 

8. 09th  October, 
2018 

12 Supreme Court of India, (01 Cases)NGT, Principal 
Bench, New Delhi ( 07 Cases), NGT Eastern Zone, 
Kolkata(02 Cases), NGT Southern Zone, 
Chennai(02 Cases) 

9 10th October, 2018 15 Supreme Court of India, (01 Cases)NGT, Principal 
Bench, New Delhi ( 07 Cases), NGT Western Zone, 
Pune(02 Cases), NGT Eastern Zone, Kolkata(02 
Case), NGT Southern Zone, Chennai(03 Cases)  

10. 11th October, 2018 11  NGT, Principal Bench, New Delhi ( 08 Cases), NGT 
Western Zone, Pune(01 Cases), NGT Central, 
Bhopal(01 Case)  NGT Eastern Zone, Kolkata(01 
Case)  

11. 12th October 2018 10 Supreme Court of India (02 Cases), NGT, Principal 
Bench, New Delhi ( 06 Cases), NGT Southern 
Zone, Chennai(01 Case), Bombay High Court(1 
Case) 

    Total Cases 118  

 

 


